INTRODUCTION FILE

CONTENTS;

FROM:

TO:

TO:

TO:
TO:

- TO: .

TO:

TO:

TO.

Bill

Objects and Reasons

Notice of Présentation

Covering letter from Minister to Clerk to Parliament

(Authorisation from Minister of Finance under s.60 of Constitution)

Attorney Generalm % 05 / (]ﬁ / 09

Minister s / ey oy .
(for signing Ob_]eG{S & Reasons, Notlce of Presentation and covering
letter to Clerk)

Minister oy Finance
(for signing of letter to Clerk signifying Cabmet approval under 5.60
of Constitution) .

r

Clerk to National Parliament
(for certificate by Speaker)

Attorney General % -Glhramrbers
(for printing)

Clerk to National Parhament /@-9—“»3
(for reference durm , 2nd and 3rd Readings)

(Date passed.....[.~ g @C‘7 . Act No ?/07

Attorney Generalzs-Chasbers }
(for checking before Assent) = 0
~ 25[18]%

Governor-General F O;’,LM '}f 1’ 2{ Dcl '

(for Assent)

Clerk to National Parliament: N2y “API/ 7[ =?

{for distribution: 1 copy Attorney General’s Chambers
I copy Ministry
1 copy Parliament Office
| copy Registrar of the High Court




CRIMINAL PROCEDURE CODE
(AMENDMENT) ACT 2009

) o (NO. 18 0f2009)




CRIMINAL PROCEDURE CODE
(AMENDMENT) ACT 2009

(NO. 18 of 2009)

PASSED by the National Parliament this seventeenth day of August 2009.
(This printed impression has been carefully compared by me with the Bill passed
by Parliament and found by me to be a true copy of the Bill)

T2y

Taeasi Sanga (Mrs)
Clerk to National Parliament

ASSENTED 1o in Her Majesty's name and on Her Majesty’s behalf this
twenty-eighth day of August 2009.

/: .O. I(_,W
Frank Utu Ofagioro 'Kabui (CSI, CMG, OBE)
Governor General

Date of Commencement: (See section 1)

AN ACT TO AMEND THE CRIMINAL PROCEDURE CODE ACT (CAP. 7) AND




CRIMINAL PROCEDURE CODE
(AMENDMENT) ACT 2009

Citation and . 1. This Act may be cited as the Criminal Procedure Code
commensemen (Amendment) Act 2009, and commences on the day appointed by the
Minister, by notice in the Gazette.

Secti%n ;1 2. Section 4 of the principal Act is amended in paragraph (c)(ii),
by deleting “two hundred dollars” and substituting “10,000 penalty units”.

Section 7 3. Section 7 of the principal Act is amended —

amended

(a) in subsection (1)(b), by deleting “one thousand
dollars” and substituting “50,000 penalty units”; and

(b)  in subsection (2)(b), by deleting “two hundred
dollars” and substituting “10,000 penalty units”.

Consequential 4. Section 27 of the Magistrates’ Courts Act (Cap. 20) is
amendment
amended —

(@)  in sub-paragraph (if) of the proviso to subsection
(1)(b), by deleting “one thousand dollars” and
substituting “50,000 penalty units™;

(b)  in subsection (2)(a)(ii), by deleting “two hundred
dollars” and substituting “10,000 penalty units”.




